


5 After this I looked, and I saw in 
heaven the temple – that is, the 
tabernacle of the covenant law – and 
it was opened. 6 Out of the temple 
came the seven angels with the 
seven plagues. They were dressed in 
clean, shining linen and wore golden 
sashes round their chests. 

Revelation 15 5-6



7 Then one of the four living 
creatures gave to the seven angels 
seven golden bowls filled with the 
wrath of God, who lives for ever and 
ever. 8 And the temple was filled with 
smoke from the glory of God and 
from his power, and no one could 
enter the temple until the seven 
plagues of the seven angels were 
completed. Revelation15.7-8



1Then I heard a loud voice from the 
temple saying to the seven angels, 
‘Go, pour out the seven bowls of 
God’s wrath on the earth.’…. 12 The 
sixth angel poured out his bowl on 
the great river Euphrates, and its 
water was dried up to prepare the 
way for the kings from the East. 

Revelation 16.1, 12



13Then I saw three impure spirits that 
looked like frogs; they came out of 
the mouth of the dragon, out of the 
mouth of the beast and out of the 
mouth of the false prophet. 14They 
are demonic spirits that perform 
signs, and they go out to the kings of 
the whole world, to gather them for 
the battle on the great day of God 
Almighty. Revelation 16. 13-14



15 ‘Look, I come like a thief! Blessed 
is the one who stays awake and 
remains clothed, so as not to go 
naked and be shamefully exposed.’  
16 Then they gathered the kings 
together to the place that in Hebrew 
is called Armageddon.…

Revelation 16.15-16



1One of the seven angels who had 
the seven bowls came and said to 
me, ‘Come, I will show you the 
punishment of the great prostitute, 
who sits by many waters. 2 With her 
the kings of the earth committed 
adultery, and the inhabitants of the 
earth were intoxicated with the wine 
of her adulteries.’

Revelation 17.1-2



3 Then the angel carried me away in 
the Spirit into a desert. There I saw a 
woman sitting on a scarlet beast that 
was covered with blasphemous names 
and had seven heads and ten horns. 4 

The woman was dressed in purple and 
scarlet, and was glittering with gold, 
precious stones and pearls. She held a 
golden cup in her hand, filled with 
abominable things and the filth of her 
adulteries. Revelation 17.3-4



5 The name written on her forehead 
was a mystery: babylon the great the 
mother of prostitutes and of the 
abominations of the earth.….
7Then the angel said to me:….9‘This 
calls for a mind with wisdom. The 
seven heads are seven hills on which 
the woman sits

Revelation 17.5, 
7, 9



10 They are also seven kings. Five 
have fallen, one is, the other has not 
yet come; but when he does come, 
he must remain for only a little while. 
11 The beast who once was, and now 
is not, is an eighth king. He belongs 
to the seven and is going to his 
destruction.’

Revelation 17.10-11




